APPENDIX B

CAPITAL REGIONAL DISTRICT
BYLAW NO. 4636

*% * ** *kkkkk *% * * * * *

A BYLAW TO AMEND HARTLAND LANDFILL TIPPING FEE
AND REGULATION BYLAW NO. 6, 2013 (BYLAW NO. 3881)

kkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkhkkkhkkkhkkkkkkhhkkkkkkkkhhkkkhkkkhkkkkkkhhkkhkkkkkkhhkkkhkkkhkkkhkhkkkhkkkkhkkkhkkhkhkkkhkkkkkkhkhkkkhkkkkhkkkkkkhkkkx

A. Under Bylaw No. 3881, “Hartland Landfill Tipping Fee and Regulation Bylaw No. 6, 2013”, the
Regional Board established fees and regulations for the operations of the Hartland Landfill;

B. The Board wishes to amend Bylaw No. 3881 to modernize the disposal cost for general refuse and
clean renovation and demolition waste, and to apply the same percent increase to the disposal cost
for controlled waste and asbestos as was applied to the general refuse and clean renovation and
demolition waste rates in Phase 1 of the material stream diversion strategy; and

C. The Board wishes to amend Bylaw No. 3881 to make housekeeping edits to the definitions of
“knotweed” and “manager” for clarity.

NOW THEREFORE, the Capital Regional District Board in open meeting assembled hereby enacts as
follows:

1. Subject to section 2 of this bylaw, Bylaw No. 3881, “Hartland Landfill Tipping Fee and Regulation Bylaw
No. 6, 2013”, is hereby amended as follows:

a) in section 1, by replacing the definition of “Knotweed” with the following definition:
‘Knotweed” means Japanese knotweed (Follopia japonica), Himalayan knotweed
(Persicaria wallichi), giant knotweed (Fallopia sachalinensis), and bohemian knotweed
(Fallopian x bohemica) plants including stems, seeds, and rhizome fragments.

b) in section 1, by replacing the definition of “Manager” with the following definition:

“‘Manager” means the General Manager of Parks, Recreation & Environmental Services of
the Capital Regional District or his or her authorized agent.

c) in Schedule “C”, by deleting the following row from the table in section 1:

- . As directed
Asbestos Containing Material by CRD staff $157 $20
and replacing it with the following row:
- . As directed
Asbestos Containing Material by CRD staff $214 $20

d) in Schedule “C”, by deleting the following rows from the table in section 1:

Clean Renovation and Demolition

Waste (effective January 1, 2024) Public Drop Off Area | $150 $10 bin fee




Bylaw No. 4636
Page 2

Clean Renovation and Demolition | As directed

Waste (effective January 1, 2024) | by CRD staff $150 $10
Refuse Active Face $150 $10
Refuse Public Drop Off Area | $150 $10 bin fee

and replacing them with the following rows:
Cjean Renovation and Demoliton | pypjic prop Off Area | $155 $10 bin fee
Clean Renovation and Demolition | As directed
Waste by CRD staff $155 $10
Refuse Active Face $155 $10
Refuse Public Drop Off Area | $155 $10 bin fee

e) in Schedule “E”, for the Controlled Wastes listed below, by deleting the “$157 per tonne” Disposal
Fee and inserting a “$214 per tonne” Disposal Fee, as follows:

Controlled Waste Disposal Fee
Animal Fecal Waste $214 per tonne
Catch Basin Waste $214 per tonne
Condemned or Spoiled Foods $214 per tonne
Contaminated Soil $214 per tonne
Fibre Optic Cable $214 per tonne
Food Processing Wastes $214 per tonne
Health Hazard Waste $214 per tonne
Miscellaneous Controlled Waste $214 per tonne
Pumpings from septage treatment facilities containing residual sludge $214 per tonne
Pumpings from sewage treatment plants, pump stations and sewer

lines $214 per tonne

Screenings from sewage treatment plants, septage treatment facilities

and pump stations $214 per tonne

Slurries which may contain non-hazardous solids, soil, sand, gravel,

fibres, fats, oils and grease or mineral oil and grease $214 per tonne

Soot and Ash $214 per tonne
Spent charcoal from water purification plants and odour filters $214 per tonne
Surface Coating Waste $214 per tonne
Vehicle Washing Facility Waste $214 per tonne
Vermiculite Insulation $214 per tonne

f) in Schedule “E”, for the Controlled Wastes listed below, by deleting the “$121 per tonne” Disposal
Fee and inserting a “$165 per tonne” Disposal Fee, as follows:

Controlled Waste Disposal Fee

Waste Sludge from sewage treatment plants containing no more than
80% total moisture

$165 per tonne




Bylaw No. 4636
Page 3

g) in Schedule “E”, for the Controlled Waste listed below, by deleting the “$150 per tonne” Disposal
Fee and inserting a “$155 per tonne” Disposal Fee, as follows:

Controlled Waste

Disposal Fee

Commercial Load of Uncontaminated Demolition Waste

$155 per tonne

2. The amendment provided in subsection 1(d) shall be made effective January 1, 2025.

3. This bylaw may be cited for all purposes as “Hartland Landfill Tipping Fee and Regulation Bylaw No.

6, 2013, Amendment Bylaw No. 6, 2024".

READ A FIRST TIME THIS th
READ A SECOND TIME THIS th
READ A THIRD TIME THIS th
ADOPTED THIS th

CHAIR

day of 2024
day of 2024
day of 2024
day of 2024

CORPORATE OFFICER



